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Disclaimer: The following resources are identified for general 

informational purposes only and are compiled with publicly 

available information or with information provided by sources that 

are publicly obtainable. Please view this document as only a 

starting point for individual research. The user should always 

directly consult the provider of a potential resource for current 

program information and to verify the applicability of a particular 

program. This is not a complete roster of all available programs. 

Resource Reports are not final policy interpretations nor 

guarantees of funding and don’t constitute an endorsement by 

FEMA for any particular program or entity. 
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Introduction 
Purpose 
The purpose of this document is to provide State, Local, Territorial, and Tribal governments with 

an overview of resources and programs capable of being used to respond to and recover from 

the impacts of natural disasters, human-made disasters, public health emergencies, economic 

hardships, humanitarian crisis, security issues, expanding incidents, and complex emergencies. 

This document is subject to change as new programs are approved, deadlines shift, and 

organizational guidance documents are released and will continue to be updated and distributed 

as needed. It is intended for use as a tool for future planning and to promote partnership 

between resource providers and state, local, territorial, and tribal entities. For the most up to 

date and accurate programmatic information, interested parties should visit each individual 

organization’s website or work directly with the relevant entity. 

Document Guidance 
This document sorts resources by primary beneficiary and upcoming deadline. 

Much of the information provided in this document was exported from FEMA’S MAX-TRAX 

Disaster Resource Library. For more information on the MAX-TRAX Disaster Resource Library 

please see the “Additional Resources” section of this document. 

Grants and Programs 
Federal Financial Resources 
 

R1. FY22 Supplemental Nutrition Assistance Program (SNAP): Process, & 

Technology Improvement (10.580) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Health and Human Services 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : Section 11(t) of the Food and Nutrition Act of 2008 (Public Law 
116-94), as amended, Grants for Simplified Application and Eligibility Determination 
Systems and Improved Access to Benefits, authorizes the Food and Nutrition Service 
Agency (FNS) to annually award up to $5 million1 in grants to State agencies 
administering the Supplemental Nutrition Assistance Program; State or local 
governments; agencies providing health or welfare services; public health or educational 
entities; or private nonprofit entities, such as community-based or faith-based 
organizations, food banks, or other emergency feeding organizations. These grants, 
known as Process and Technology Improvement Grants, allow applicants to “develop 
and implement supplemental nutrition assistance program simplified application and 
eligibility determination systems.”  

Process and Technology Improvement Grants support efforts by State agencies and 
their community-based and faith-based partners to develop and implement projects that 
focus on improving the quality and efficiency of Supplemental Nutrition Assistance 
Program (SNAP) operations and processes. 
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FY22 NOFO (Grants.gov): 
https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=339808 

 

Total Program Funding: $5,000,000 

Max Award: $2,000,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations, 
State, Territory Nonprofits having a 501(c)(3) status with the IRS, other than institutions 
of higher education 
County governments 
State governments 
City or township governments 
 
The 53 State agencies that administer SNAP; State or local governments; Agencies 
providing health or welfare services; Public health or educational entities; and Private 
non-profit entities such as community-based or faith-based organizations, food banks, or 
other emergency feeding organizations. 

Application Deadline: Jun-27-2022 

Application Process: FY22 NOFO (Grants.gov): 
https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=339808 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=339808 
 

R2. FY22 Local Food for Schools (LFS) 

Resource Type: Cooperative Agreement  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The U.S. Department of Agriculture (USDA), Agricultural 
Marketing Service (AMS), requests applications from state governments for the Local 
Food for Schools (LFS) Program. The goal will be to establish cooperative agreements 
with state governments for the purpose of purchasing domestic, locally grown foods from 
local producers, small businesses, and socially disadvantaged farmers/producers for 
distribution to schools. AMS will make only one award per state government; agencies 
within the state must coordinate if more than one agency wishes to implement this 
program. The state governments can also partner with local organizations. Up to $200 
million is available from funds authorized under section 5(c) of the Commodity Credit 
Corporation Charter Act (15 USC 714c(c)). This announcement identifies the eligibility 
criteria for LFS applicants, the application forms, and associated instructions needed to 
apply for an LFS award. AMS encourages applications that benefit both small 
businesses and socially disadvantaged farmers/producers and provides food distribution 
to schools. For cooperative agreements intending to serve these entities, applicants 
should engage and involve those beneficiaries when developing projects and 
applications. AMS would like these relationships and purchase and distribution channels 
to continue past the conclusion of this program.  

https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=339808
https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=339808
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The Local Food for Schools Cooperative Agreement Program (LFS) is authorized by 
section 5(c) of the Commodity Credit Corporation Charter Act (15 USC 714c(c)). 

The purpose of this program is to increase purchasing of local and regional foods for 
distribution to schools. 

The program achieves this purpose in the overarching goals below:  
1. Provide an opportunity for states to strengthen their local and regional food system. 
2. Help to support local, small, and socially disadvantaged farmers/producers through 
building and expanding economic opportunities. 
3. Establish and broaden partnerships with farmers/producers and schools to ensure 
distribution of fresh and nutritious foods. 

Program page: https://www.ams.usda.gov/selling-food-to-usda/lfs 

FY22 NOFO (Grants.gov): https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-
opportunity.html?oppId=338749 

https://www.ams.usda.gov/sites/default/files/media/LFS_RFA.pdf 

 Total Program Funding: $200,000,000 

Max Award: California: $23,071,364 

Eligibility and Description/Use: State, Territory State & Territory Governments 

Application Deadline: Jun-17-2022 

Application Process: Allocations to States will be based on enrollment share and States 
must ensure equitable distribution to individual school districts as is required. 
 
Program page: https://www.ams.usda.gov/selling-food-to-usda/lfs 
 
FY22 NOFO (Grants.gov): https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-
opportunity.html?oppId=338749 
 
https://www.ams.usda.gov/sites/default/files/media/LFS_RFA.pdf 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://www.ams.usda.gov/selling-food-to-usda/lfs 

 

R3. FY22 Agriculture & Food Research Initiative (AFRI): Sustainable 

Agricultural Systems (SAS) (10.310) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The Agriculture and Food Research Initiative's Sustainable 
Agricultural Systems (SAS) program area promotes the sustainable supply of abundant, 
affordable, safe, nutritious, and accessible food and other agricultural products, while 
enhancing economic opportunities and improving the long-term health and well-being of 
all Americans.  

SAS seeks to help transform the U.S. food and agricultural system to increase 
production in sustainable ways as we approach a world population of 10 billion by 2050, 

https://www.ams.usda.gov/selling-food-to-usda/lfs
https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=338749
https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=338749
https://www.ams.usda.gov/sites/default/files/media/LFS_RFA.pdf
https://www.ams.usda.gov/selling-food-to-usda/lfs
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and doing so in the context of diminishing land and water resources, changing climate 
and increasing frequency of extreme weather events, threats of outbreaks of diseases 
and pests, and challenges to human health and well-being. Solving these challenges will 
require a convergence of science and technology to: optimize agricultural productivity; 
ensure safe, affordable, and nutritious supply of food; invigorate and realize the promise 
of the bioeconomy; and promote the development of a talented agricultural workforce. 

Funding will support projects focused on increasing agricultural productivity; optimizing 
water and nitrogen use efficiency; protecting yield losses from stresses, diseases, and 
pests; reducing food-borne diseases; and advancing development of biobased fuels, 
chemicals, and coproducts. This RFA is soliciting creative and visionary project 
applications that use transdisciplinary teams and integrated research, education, and 
extension/outreach activities to promote convergence of science and technology to solve 
present and future food and agricultural production system challenges. 

Successful projects will consider what has contributed to present successes of U.S. food 
and agriculture systems, and challenges to continued and future success. Agricultural 
systems are inclusive of values chains from production to consumption for food or other 
products from farms, ranches, and managed forests across the rural-urban continuum 
from conventional open-fields to controlled production in built environments. 
Consideration must be given for how new strategies or other technical interventions may 
alter many factors involved in the conduct of the system. Applicants must demonstrate 
changes that are crucial to safeguarding the food and agricultural supply while ensuring 
the viability of the entire value chain. This includes profitability, natural resources quality, 
food safety and quality, and the health and well-being of people and communities. 
Additionally, the systems must help develop and execute approaches to reducing the 
ecological footprint, including, but not limited to, water and nutrient use, greenhouse 
gases, and energy use. 

FY22 NOFO (Grants.gov): 
https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=338563 

https://nifa.usda.gov/funding-opportunity/afri-sustainable-agricultural-systems-
competitive-grants-program 

https://nifa.usda.gov/sites/default/files/rfa/FY22-AFRI-SAS-RFA-508v2.pdf 

Total Program Funding: $80,000,000 

Max Award: $10,000,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Agricultural Producers, Individuals & Households, 
Public/Private Institutions of Higher Education  

Application Deadline: Jul-28-2022 

Application Process: Applications are submitted through Grants.gov, review all 
requirements: 
 
FY22 NOFO (Grants.gov): 
https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=338563 
 
https://nifa.usda.gov/funding-opportunity/afri-sustainable-agricultural-systems-
competitive-grants-program 
 
https://nifa.usda.gov/sites/default/files/rfa/FY22-AFRI-SAS-RFA-508v2.pdf 

https://www.grants.gov/web/grants/view-opportunity.html?oppId=338563
https://nifa.usda.gov/funding-opportunity/afri-sustainable-agricultural-systems-competitive-grants-program
https://nifa.usda.gov/funding-opportunity/afri-sustainable-agricultural-systems-competitive-grants-program
https://nifa.usda.gov/sites/default/files/rfa/FY22-AFRI-SAS-RFA-508v2.pdf
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Cost Share: Yes. Match Required – Applicants MUST provide matching contributions on 
a dollar-for-dollar basis for all Federal funds awarded under the AFRI Sustainable 
Agricultural Systems RFA. 

Reference Link: https://nifa.usda.gov/funding-opportunity/afri-sustainable-agricultural-
systems-competitive-grants-program 

 

R4. Team Nutrition Grants Program (10.574) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : Team Nutrition, an initiative of the United States Department of 
Agriculture's Food and Nutrition Service, supports national efforts to promote lifelong 
healthy food choices and physical activity by improving the nutrition practices of the 
Child Nutrition Programs. We provide resources to schools, child care settings, and 
summer meal sites that participate in these programs.  

Team Nutrition delivers consistent nutrition messages to children and their caregivers 
through multiple communication channels: 1) food service initiatives, 2) classroom and 
child care activities, 3) school-wide events, 4) home activities, 5) community programs 
and events, and 6) traditional and social media. 

  

Program webpage: 

https://www.fns.usda.gov/tn/team-nutrition  

Additional information on resources: https://www.fns.usda.gov/tn/team-nutrition-
resource-catalog 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: For-Profit Organizations, Local Government & Authority, 
Nonprofit Organizations, Public/Private Institutions of Education K-12 Schools 
participating in the National School Lunch Program are invited to sign up as Team 
Nutrition Schools, and join an important network of schools working towards healthier 
school nutrition and physical activity environments. Today, almost half of the schools 
participating in the National School Lunch Program have signed up to be Team Nutrition 
Schools! 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Looking for all of Team Nutrition's information and resources in one 
place? Look no further than the NEW Team Nutrition Resource Catalog. It includes a full 
listing of all of Team Nutrition materials. All Team Nutrition resources are available on 
the Team Nutrition Web site in our Resource Library. Schools, child care providers 
(centers, sponsors, and day care homes), and summer meal sites that participate in 
USDA Child Nutrition programs may request free printed copies of certain materials. 
Printed materials may also be requested by the State agency administering the USDA 
Child Nutrition programs and school districts. Eligible entities may request printed copies 
using our online order form. 

https://nifa.usda.gov/funding-opportunity/afri-sustainable-agricultural-systems-competitive-grants-program
https://nifa.usda.gov/funding-opportunity/afri-sustainable-agricultural-systems-competitive-grants-program
https://www.fns.usda.gov/tn/about-team-nutrition
https://www.fns.usda.gov/tn/team-nutrition-resource-catalog
https://www.fns.usda.gov/tn/team-nutrition-resource-catalog
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Cost Share:   

Reference Link: https://www.fns.usda.gov/tn 

 

R5. Commodity Supplemental Food Program (CSFP) (10.565) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The Commodity Supplemental Food Program (CSFP) works to 
improve the health of low-income persons at least 60 years of age by supplementing 
their diets with nutritious USDA Foods. USDA distributes both food and administrative 
funds to participating states and Indian Tribal Organizations to operate CSFP.  

USDA distributes both food and administrative funds to participating states and Indian 
Tribal Organizations to operate CSFP. State agencies distribute CSFP food to public 
and nonprofit private local agencies. Local agencies determine the eligibility of 
applicants, distribute the foods, and provide nutrition education. 

Fact Sheet: https://www.fns.usda.gov/csfp/csfp-fact-sheet / Commodity Supplemental 
Food Program Factsheet (azureedge.net) 

  

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Individuals & Households, Local Government & Authority, 
State, Territory, Tribe As required by the Agricultural Act of 2014 ([PL 113-
79|https://www.fns.usda.gov/pl-113-79]), women, infants, and children who apply to 
participate in CSFP on Feb. 7, 2014, or later cannot be certified to participate in the 
program. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: USDA distributes both food and administrative funds to 
participating states and Indian Tribal Organizations to operate CSFP. State agencies 
distribute CSFP food to public and nonprofit private local agencies. Local agencies 
determine the eligibility of applicants, distribute the foods, and provide nutrition 
education. Fact Sheet: https://www.fns.usda.gov/csfp/csfp-fact-sheet 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://www.fns.usda.gov/csfp/commodity-supplemental-food-program 
 

R6. NRCS Conservation Technical Assistance Program (CTA) 

Resource Type: Technical Assistance  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Program Description : The  Conservation Technical Assistance Program 
(CTA) provides our nation’s farmers, ranchers and forestland owners with the knowledge 
and tools they need to conserve, maintain and restore the natural resources on their 
lands and improve the health of their operations for the future.  

https://www.fns.usda.gov/tn
https://www.fns.usda.gov/csfp/csfp-fact-sheet
https://fns-prod.azureedge.net/sites/default/files/resource-files/csfp-program-fact-sheet-2019.pdf
https://fns-prod.azureedge.net/sites/default/files/resource-files/csfp-program-fact-sheet-2019.pdf
https://www.fns.usda.gov/csfp/commodity-supplemental-food-program
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NRCS offers this assistance at no cost to the producers we serve. Our goal is to give our 
customers personalized advice and information, based on the latest science and 
research, to help them make informed decisions. 

If a producer chooses to take the next step towards improving their operations, we can 
work with them to develop a conservation plan, with suggested conservation practices 
that can help them reach their production and conservation goals. 

They can also choose to apply for financial assistance to get help installing the 
conservation practices outlined in their conservation plan. 

NRCS has local Service Centers across the country to help farmers, ranchers and 
foresters get started. 

• Program 
webpage: https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/main/national/programs/tec
hnical/ 

• Disaster Recovery Assistance | NRCS 
(usda.gov): https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detailfull/national/program
s/?cid=nrcseprd1361073  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Individuals & Households, Local Government & Authority 
All owners, managers, and others who have a stake and interest in natural resource 
management are eligible to receive technical assistance from NRCS. To receive 
technical assistance, the individual may contact their local NRCS office or the local 
conservation district.  
 
CTA is available to any group or individual interested in conserving our natural resources 
and sustaining agricultural production in this country. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Conservation Technical Assistance is offered at no cost to the 
farmers, ranchers and forest landowners we serve. For more information about 
Conservation Technical Assistance or to develop a conservation plan, contact your local 
USDA Service Center, or your local conservation district. 
https://offices.sc.egov.usda.gov/locator/app 
 
All requests for technical assistance through the CTA Program are prioritized by NRCS 
and the local conservation district to ensure that assistance is provided in a fair and 
equitable manner. 
 
Through the CTA Program, customers may choose to develop conservation plans, which 
can serve as a springboard for other programs, including financial assistance and 
easement conservation programs. 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: 
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/main/national/programs/technical/ 

 

https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/main/national/programs/technical/cta
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detail/national/newsroom/features/?cid=stelprdb1193811
https://offices.sc.egov.usda.gov/locator/app
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/main/national/programs/technical/
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/main/national/programs/technical/
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detailfull/national/programs/?cid=nrcseprd1361073
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detailfull/national/programs/?cid=nrcseprd1361073
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/main/national/programs/technical/
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R7. Water & Waste Disposal Grants to Alleviate Health Risks on Tribal Lands & 

Colonias (10.770) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : This program provides low-income communities, that face 
significant health risks, access to safe, reliable drinking water and waste disposal 
facilities and services.  

Funds may be used for: 

• Construction of basic drinking water and waste disposal systems, including storm 
drainage 

Colonias – This is a term used to describe subdivisions located outside incorporated 
areas along the U.S.-Mexico border where residents face significant health risks due to a 
significant portion of the community lacking access to clean, reliable, affordable drinking 
water and/or waste disposal systems. 

Federally recognized tribes - federally recognized tribes are eligible for many USDA 
Rural Development programs. A list of all federally recognized tribes is published in the 
Federal Register and posted at  https://www.bia.gov/tribal-leaders-directory. Additionally, 
a few RD programs include tribes on state reservations as eligible applicants. More 
information on those programs is available at the Government Accountability Office site. 

Tribal Lands – USDA Rural Development can help finance projects on Indian lands in 
rural areas. For further information on Indian lands and other American Indian/Alaska 
Native topics, visit the Department of Interior's Bureau of Indian Affairs 
website: www.bia.gov/FAQs. 

Program Webpage: 
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-environmental-programs/water-waste-
disposal-grants-alleviate-health-risks-tribal-lands-and-colonias 

Program Fact Sheet: 
https://www.rd.usda.gov/sites/default/files/fact-sheet/508_RD_FS_RUS_TribalWWD.pdf 

 Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations, 
State, Territory, Tribe * State and local governmental entities serving eligible areas 
 * Nonprofit organizations 
 * Utility districts serving Colonias 
 * Federally recognized tribes 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Applications are accepted year round through local RD office: 
https://www.rd.usda.gov/contact-us/state-offices 

Cost Share: No. Partnerships with other federal, state and local entities are encouraged; 
however, a 100 percent grant may be offered in some circumstances if funds are 
available. 

https://www.bia.gov/tribal-leaders-directory
http://www.gao.gov/
http://www.bia.gov/FAQs
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-environmental-programs/water-waste-disposal-grants-alleviate-health-risks-tribal-lands-and-colonias
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-environmental-programs/water-waste-disposal-grants-alleviate-health-risks-tribal-lands-and-colonias
https://www.rd.usda.gov/sites/default/files/fact-sheet/508_RD_FS_RUS_TribalWWD.pdf
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Reference Link: https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-waste-disposal-
grants-alleviate-health-risks-tribal-lands-and-colonias 

 

R8. FY21 Water & Waste Disposal Loan & Grant Program (10.770) 

Resource Type: Grant and Loan  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : This program provides funding for clean and reliable drinking 
water systems, sanitary sewage disposal, sanitary solid waste disposal, and storm water 
drainage to households and businesses in eligible rural areas.  

Funds may be used to finance the acquisition, construction or improvement of: drinking 
water sourcing, treatment, storage and distribution; sewer collection, transmission, 
treatment and disposal; solid waste collection, disposal and closure; storm water 
collection, transmission and disposal. 

In some cases, funding may also be available for related activities such as: legal and 
engineering fees; land acquisition, water and land rights, permits and equipment; start-
up operations and maintenance; interest incurred during construction; purchase of 
facilities to improve service or prevent loss of service; other costs determined to be 
necessary for completion of the project. 

NOFA: 

https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-waste-disposal-loan-grant-program  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: For-Profit Organizations, Local Government & Authority, 
Nonprofit Organizations, State, Territory, Tribe This program assists qualified applicants 
who are not otherwise able to obtain commercial credit on reasonable terms. Eligible 
applicants include: most state and local governmental entities; private nonprofits; 
federally-recognized tribes. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Applications are accepted year round and may be filed 
electronically using RD Apply: 
https://www.rd.usda.gov/files/Water_and_Environmental_Customer_User_Guide.pdf  
Fact Sheet: https://www.rd.usda.gov/sites/default/files/fact-
sheet/508_RD__FS_RUS_WEPDirect.pdf 
Applications are also accepted through your local RD office: 
https://www.rd.usda.gov/page/state-offices 

Cost Share:  Current interest rates for 2nd Quarter FY 2021, effective January 1, 2021 to 
March 31, 2021: 
Poverty: 1.250% 
Intermediate: 1.750% 
Market: 2.125% 
 

https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-waste-disposal-grants-alleviate-health-risks-tribal-lands-and-colonias
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-waste-disposal-grants-alleviate-health-risks-tribal-lands-and-colonias
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-waste-disposal-loan-grant-program
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Reference Link: https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-waste-disposal-loan-
grant-program 

 

R9. Emergency Community Water Assistance Grants Program (10.763) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : This program helps eligible communities prepare, or recover from, 
an emergency that threatens the availability of safe, reliable drinking water.  

• Water transmission line grants up to $150,000 to construct waterline extensions, 
repair breaks or leaks in existing water distribution lines, and address related 
maintenance necessary to replenish the water supply 

• Water source grants up to $1,000,000 are to construct a water source, intake or 
treatment facility 

This program helps eligible communities prepare, or recover from, an emergency that 
threatens the availability of safe, reliable drinking water. The following events qualify as 
an emergency: 

• Drought or flood 

• Earthquake 

• Tornado or hurricane 

• Disease outbreak 

• Chemical spill, leak, or seepage 

• Other disasters 

NOTE: A federal disaster declaration is not required. 

Applications for this program are accepted year round: 
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/rd-apply  
State Offices: https://www.rd.usda.gov/page/state-offices  

NOFA (RHIhub): 

https://www.ruralhealthinfo.org/funding/4795  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: $1,000,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations, 
State, Territory, Tribe Eligible beneficiaries include (1) Public bodies or governmental 
entities such as municipalities, counties, districts, authorities, and other political 
subdivisions of a State, (2) nonprofit organizations such as associations, cooperatives, 
and private nonprofit corporations, (3) Native American Indian tribes on Federal and 
State reservations and other federally recognized Indian tribes. Projects must serve rural 
areas, excluding any city or town having a population greater than 10,000. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-waste-disposal-loan-grant-program
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/water-waste-disposal-loan-grant-program
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/rd-apply
https://www.rd.usda.gov/page/state-offices
https://www.ruralhealthinfo.org/funding/4795
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Application Process: Applications for this program are accepted year round: 
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/rd-apply 
State Offices: https://www.rd.usda.gov/page/state-offices 
Events that can qualify as emergencies: drought or flood; earthquake; tornado or 
hurricane; disease outbreak; chemical spill, leak or seepage; other disasters. A federal 
disaster declaration is not required. 

Cost Share: No. Partnerships with other federal, state, local, private, and nonprofit 
entities are encouraged. 

Reference Link: https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/emergency-community-
water-assistance-grants 

 

R10. Special Supplemental Nutrition Program for Women, Infants, & Children 

(WIC) (10.557) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : To provide low-income pregnant, breastfeeding and postpartum 
women, infants, and children to age five who have been determined to be at nutritional 
risk, supplemental nutritious foods, nutrition education, and referrals to health and social 
services at no cost. WIC also promotes breastfeeding as the feeding method of choice 
for infants, provides substance abuse education and promotes immunization and other 
aspects of healthy living.  

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Local agencies and retailers must apply to the State agency in 
writing. State agencies must submit required documentation to FNS. 
https://www.fns.usda.gov/wic/wic-how-apply 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://www.fns.usda.gov/wic 
 

R11. Emergency Haying & Grazing 

Resource Type: Grant and Cooperative Agreement  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : To help livestock producers in approved counties when the growth 
and yield of hay and pasture have been substantially reduced because of a widespread 
natural disaster.  

The U.S. Department of Agriculture (USDA) Farm Service Agency (FSA) administers the 
Conservation Reserve Program (CRP), a federally funded voluntary program that 
contracts with agricultural producers so that environmentally sensitive agricultural land is 

https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/emergency-community-water-assistance-grants
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/emergency-community-water-assistance-grants
https://www.fns.usda.gov/wic
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not farmed or ranched, but instead used for conservation benefits. Participants establish 
long-term, resource-conserving plant species, such as approved grasses or trees 
(known as “covers”), to control soil erosion, improve water quality and develop wildlife 
habitat. In return, FSA provides participants with rental payments and cost-share 
assistance. Contract duration is between 10 and 15 years. 

Haying and grazing of CRP acres is authorized under certain conditions to improve the 
quality and performance of the CRP cover or to provide emergency relief to livestock 
producers due to certain natural disasters. There are two types of haying and grazing 
authorization: non-emergency and emergency. 

Program Topic Page:  
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/conservation-programs/conservation-
reserve-program/emergency-haying-and-grazing/index 

CRP Haying and Grazing Emergency and Non-Emergency Use (Fact Sheet): 
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Assets/USDA-FSA 
Public/usdafiles/FactSheets/crp_haying_grazing_factsheet.pdf 

  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Agricultural Producers, For-Profit Organizations, 
Individuals & Households, Local Government & Authority, State  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Fact Sheet (May 2021): https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Assets/USDA-
FSA-Public/usdafiles/FactSheets/crp_haying_grazing_factsheet.pdf 
Tables & Maps:  
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/conservation-programs/conservation-
reserve-program/emergency-haying-and-grazing/index 
Emergency authorization is provided by either a national FSA office authorization or by a 
state FSA committee determination utilizing the U.S. Drought Monitor. 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/conservation-
programs/conservation-reserve-program/emergency-haying-and-grazing/index 

 

R12. Farm Ownership Loans (10.407) 

Resource Type: Loan  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : FSA’s Direct Farm Ownership loans are used to:  

• buy a farm or ranch 

• enlarge an existing farm or ranch 

• make a down payment on a farm 

https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/conservation-programs/conservation-reserve-program/emergency-haying-and-grazing/index
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/conservation-programs/conservation-reserve-program/emergency-haying-and-grazing/index
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Assets/USDA-FSA-Public/usdafiles/FactSheets/crp_haying_grazing_factsheet.pdf
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Assets/USDA-FSA-Public/usdafiles/FactSheets/crp_haying_grazing_factsheet.pdf
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/conservation-programs/conservation-reserve-program/emergency-haying-and-grazing/index
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/conservation-programs/conservation-reserve-program/emergency-haying-and-grazing/index
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• purchase of easements 

• construct, purchase or improve farm dwellings, service buildings or other facilities 
and improvements essential to the farm operation 

• promote soil and water conservation and protection 

• pay loan closing costs 

There are 3 types of Direct Farm Ownership Loans: "regular," joint financing, and down 
payment depending upon individual needs. FSA also offers a Direct Farm Ownership 
Microloan for smaller financial needs. 

Farm Ownership Loans offer up to 100 percent financing and are a valuable resource to 
help farmers and ranchers purchase or enlarge family farms, improve and expand 
current operations, increase agricultural productivity, and assist with land tenure to save 
farmland for future generations. With a maximum loan amount of $600,000 ($300,150 for 
Beginning Farmer Down Payment), all FSA Direct Farm Ownership Loans are financed 
and serviced by the Agency through local Farm Loan Officers and Farm Loan Managers. 
The funding comes from Congressional appropriations as part of the USDA budget. 

• Fact Sheet: Farm Loans Overview (PDF) 

• Direct Loan Making Handbook 3-FLP (PDF) 

• National Agrability Project 

• Farm Answers Library 

• Farmers.gov 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: $600,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Agricultural Producers, Individuals & Households, Local 
Government & Authority  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Guide: 
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Internet/FSA_File/fsa_br_01_web_booklet.pdf 
Contact your lender if you are interested in an FSA guaranteed loan. Your lender will 
assist you in preparing the forms needed. The forms for a guaranteed loan application 
may be obtained from the local FSA office or from the FSA website: 
http://forms.sc.egov.usda.gov/eForms/ 
welcomeAction.do?Home  

Cost Share: Yes. Interest Rates: https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-
loan-programs/index 
 

Reference Link: https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-
programs/farm-ownership-loans/ 

 

R13. Community Facilities Direct Loan & Grant Program (10.766) 

Resource Type: Grant and Loan  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-programs/microloans/index
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-programs/microloans/index
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/state-offices/index
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-programs/funding/index
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Assets/USDA-FSA-Public/usdafiles/FactSheets/farm_loans_overview-factsheet.pdf
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Internet/FSA_File/3-flp_r02_a34.pdf
http://www.agrability.org/
https://farmanswers.org/
https://www.farmers.gov/
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-programs/farm-ownership-loans/
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-programs/farm-ownership-loans/
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Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : This program provides affordable funding to develop essential 
community facilities in rural areas. An essential community facility is defined as a facility 
that provides an essential service to the local community for the orderly development of 
the community in a primarily rural area, and does not include private, commercial or 
business undertakings.  

Eligible borrowers include: 

• Public bodies; 

• Community-based non-profit corporations; AND 

• Federally-recognized Tribes. 

Funds can be used to purchase, construct, and/or improve essential community 
facilities. Funds may also be used to acquire land needed for a facility, to pay necessary 
professional fees, or to purchase equipment required for a facility's operation. All 
facilities financed in whole or in part with RHS funds shall be for public use. 

Community facilities include (but are not limited to) those providing or supporting overall 
community development - such as hospitals, fire protection, public safety, libraries, 
education facilities, child care facilities, food recovery and distribution centers, assisted 
living facilities, group homes, mental health clinics, and shelters. Projects comprise 
community, social, health care, education, cultural, transportation, industrial park sites, 
fire and rescue services, access ways, and utility extensions. Examples of essential 
community facilities include: 

• Health care facilities such as hospitals, medical clinics, dental clinics, nursing 
homes or assisted living facilities; 

• Public facilities such as town halls, courthouses, airport hangars or street 
improvements; 

• Community support services such as child care centers, community centers, 
fairgrounds or transitional housing; 

• Public safety services such as fire departments, police stations, prisons, police 
vehicles, fire trucks, public works vehicles or equipment; 

• Educational services such as museums, libraries or private schools; 

• Utility services such as telemedicine or distance learning equipment; AND 

• Local food systems such as community gardens, food pantries, community 
kitchens, food banks, food hubs or greenhouses. 

Applicants may apply for one of three options: the Community Facilities Direct Loan 
Program, the Community Facilities Grant Program, or a combination of the 
two. Applications accepted on an ongoing basis. 

  

Community Facilities Direct Loan Program - Guidance Book for Applicants: 

https://www.rd.usda.gov/files/508_RD_RHS_CF_DirectLoanGuidanceBook_090919.pdf  

Program webpage: 

https://www.rd.usda.gov/files/508_RD_RHS_CF_DirectLoanGuidanceBook_090919.pdf
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https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/community-facilities-direct-loan-grant-
program 

FY21 NOFA (RHIhub): 

https://www.ruralhealthinfo.org/funding/91  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations, 
State, Tribe City, county, and state agencies; political and quasi-political subdivisions of 
states and associations, including corporations; Indian tribes on federal and state 
reservations and other federally recognized Indian tribes; and existing private 
corporations which: 
 # Are operated on a not-for-profit basis; 
 # Have or will have the legal authority necessary for constructing, operating, and 
maintaining the proposed facility or service and for obtaining, giving security for, and 
repaying the loan; AND 
 # Are unable to finance the proposed project from its own resources or through 
commercial credit at reasonable rates and terms.  
 
Grants are available to public entities such as municipalities, counties, and special-
purpose districts, as well as nonprofit corporations and tribal governments. 
 
Loans are also available to public entities such as municipalities, counties, and special-
purpose districts, as well as to nonprofit corporations and tribal governments. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Applications accepted on an ongoing basis.  Begin the application 
process by contacting the appropriate USDA Rural Development state office to discuss 
the project:  https://www.rd.usda.gov/about-rd/state-offices. 

Cost Share: Yes. Loans:  Interest rates are set by Rural Development, contact local 
offices for details and current rates. 
 
Grants:  Grant assistance is limited to the following percentages of eligible project costs: 
Maximum of 75%. 

Reference Link: https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/community-facilities-direct-
loan-grant-program 

 

R14. Families First Coronavirus Response Act: FY20 Coronavirus Pandemic 

EBT (P-EBT) 

Resource Type:   

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Supplemental 

Program Description : The Families First Coronavirus Response Act of 2020 provides 
the Secretary of Agriculture authority to approve state agency plans for temporary 
emergency standards of eligibility and levels of benefits under the Food and Nutrition Act 

https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/community-facilities-direct-loan-grant-program
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/community-facilities-direct-loan-grant-program
https://www.ruralhealthinfo.org/funding/91
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/community-facilities-direct-loan-grant-program
https://www.rd.usda.gov/programs-services/community-facilities-direct-loan-grant-program
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of 2008. Children who would receive free or reduced-price meals under the Richard B. 
Russell National School Lunch Act if not for the school closure are eligible under this 
provision. State agencies may submit plans in any case in which a school is closed for at 
least 5 consecutive days during a public health emergency designation during which the 
school would otherwise be in session.  

With FNS approval, Pandemic EBT (P-EBT) benefits are available for Supplemental 
Nutrition Assistance Program (SNAP) and non-SNAP households with children who 
have temporarily lost access to free or reduced-price school meals due to pandemic-
related school facility closures. 

https://www.fns.usda.gov/snap/state-guidance-coronavirus-pandemic-ebt-pebt 

  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Individuals & Households Households are eligible if they 
include an eligible child or children, who if not for the school facility closure during a 
public health emergency designation and due to concerns about a COVID-19 outbreak, 
would receive free or reduced-price (FRP) school meals (National School Lunch 
Program (NSLP) or School Breakfast Program (SBP), and the child’s school facility will 
be (or has been) closed for at least 5 consecutive days during a public health emergency 
designation and due to concerns about a COVID-19 outbreak. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Process guidance to States can be found at:  https://fns-
prod.azureedge.net/sites/default/files/resource-files/SNAP-CN-COVID-
PEBTGuidance.pdf 
 
All 50 states plus the District of Columbia and U.S. Virgin Islands have been approved 
for Pandemic EBT 

Cost Share:   

Reference Link: https://www.fns.usda.gov/snap/state-guidance-coronavirus-pandemic-
ebt-pebt 

 

R15. CARES Act:  Public Assistance - Category B (97.036) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Federal Emergency Management Agency 

Funding Type: Supplemental 

Program Description : FEMA may provide funding to eligible applicants for costs related 
to emergency protective measures conducted as a result of the COVID-19 
pandemic.  Emergency protective measures are activities conducted before, during and 
after an incident to eliminate or lessen immediate threats to life, public health, and 
safety.  Eligible applicants may submit requests for reimbursement to the recipient and 
FEMA through the Public Assistance Grants Portal.  

https://www.fns.usda.gov/snap/state-guidance-coronavirus-pandemic-ebt-pebt
https://www.fns.usda.gov/snap/state-guidance-coronavirus-pandemic-ebt-pebt
https://www.fns.usda.gov/snap/state-guidance-coronavirus-pandemic-ebt-pebt
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The provision of services to address immediate needs resulting from the COVID-19 
pandemic may be eligible for reimbursement under Category B (Emergency Protective 
Measures) of FEMA’s Public Assistance (PA) Program.  During the COVID-19 
Nationwide Emergency Declaration, FEMA recognizes that food distribution by food 
banks may be necessary when food security has been impacted and food distribution is 
necessary to protect public health and safety.  FEMA may provide funding for these 
activities at the prevailing cost share for the applicable declaration.  FEMA may approve 
funding to an SLTT government for an initial 30-day time period. 

  

Program webpage: 

https://www.fema.gov/assistance/public  

Eligible Emergency Protective Measures: 

https://www.fema.gov/news-release/2020/03/19/coronavirus-covid-19-pandemic-eligible-
emergency-protective-measures  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Public/Indian Housing 
Authorities, State, Territory, Tribe Under the COVID-19 Emergency Declaration, FEMA 
may provide assistance for emergency protective measures including, but not limited to, 
the following, if not funded by the HHS/CDC or other federal agency: Management, 
control and reduction of immediate threats to public health and safety, Emergency 
medical care; Medical sheltering. Food banks are not eligible for direct reimbursement 
by FEMA; however, state, local, tribal, and territorial (SLTT) governments may seek 
reimbursement from FEMA. While FEMA will not duplicate assistance provided by other 
federal agencies, this activity is eligible for reimbursement as an emergency protective 
measure for 30 days despite the availability of funds from other agencies—due to 
extraordinary circumstances of the COVID-19 public health emergency. 
 Indicators of negative food security impacts, which may demonstrate the need to fund 
the distribution of food in response to the COVID-19 pandemic, include: Documented 
decreases of in-kind donations to food backs; Reduced mobility of people in need due to 
government-imposed restrictions; Marked increase or atypical demand for feeding 
resources; or disruptions to the typical food supply chain in the jurisdiction. 
 Recipients should work through their FEMA regional point of contacts to make sure that 
the following forms/paperwork have been filled out before applying for a grant: FEMA 
State/Tribal/Territorial Agreements, Signed Federal Grant Applications (SF-424), 
Updated Recipient Public Assistance (PA) Administrative Plans. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: How to Apply: https://www.fema.gov/assistance/public/apply 
1. Recipients attend virtual applicant briefing.  
2. Public Assistance (PA) Grants Portal account is created.  
3. Request for Public Assistance (RPA) is submitted.  
4. COVID-19 Streamlined Project Application is submitted.  
5. FEMA and Recipient review documents. 6. Applicant signs project. Funding received 
through recipient. 

https://www.fema.gov/assistance/public
https://www.fema.gov/news-release/2020/03/19/coronavirus-covid-19-pandemic-eligible-emergency-protective-measures
https://www.fema.gov/news-release/2020/03/19/coronavirus-covid-19-pandemic-eligible-emergency-protective-measures
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Cost Share: Yes. 75-25: State, territorial, tribal, and local government entities and certain 
private non-profit organizations are eligible to apply for Public Assistance. FEMA 
assistance will be provided at a 75 percent federal cost share. This assistance will 
require execution of a FEMA-State/Tribal/Territory Agreement, as appropriate, and 
execution of an applicable emergency plan. Local governments and other eligible PA 
applicants will apply through their respective state, tribal or territorial jurisdictions. 

Reference Link: https://www.fema.gov/news-release/2020/03/19/coronavirus-covid-19-
pandemic-eligible-emergency-protective-measures 

 

R16. CARES Act: FY20-21 Child Nutrition Programs (10.553) 

Resource Type: Program Delivery  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Supplemental 

Program Description : For an additional amount for Child Nutrition Programs, 
$8,800,000,000 to remain available until September 30, 2021, to prevent, prepare for, 
and respond to coronavirus, domestically or internationally: Provided, That such amount 
is designated by the Congress as being for an emergency requirement pursuant to 
section 251(b)(2)(A)( i )  of the Balanced Budget and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 
1985.  

Program Purpose: To prevent, prepare for, and respond to coronavirus - domestically or 
internationally.  

USDA has issued a series of question and answer documents on flexibilities and waivers 
for the child nutrition programs intended to support effective operations and provide 
meals while also supporting social distancing in order to reduce the exposure to the 
novel coronavirus (COVID-19). 

  

IA Relevant Programs: Feeding (MC/EA) 

Total Program Funding: $8,800,000,000 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Individuals & Households, Local Government & Authority, 
Nonprofit Organizations, Public/Private Institutions of Education K-12, Public/Private 
Institutions of Higher Education, State, Territory, Tribe SLTTs in partnership with Federal 
Childhood Nutrition Programs. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19 

 

R17. COVID-19 Supplementals:  FY20-21 The Emergency Food Assistance 

Program (TEFAP) 

Resource Type: Program Delivery  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

https://www.fema.gov/news-release/2020/03/19/coronavirus-covid-19-pandemic-eligible-emergency-protective-measures
https://www.fema.gov/news-release/2020/03/19/coronavirus-covid-19-pandemic-eligible-emergency-protective-measures
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19
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Funding Type: Supplemental 

Program Description : Families First Coronavirus Response Act (FFCRA) provided $400 
million.  Allocations to state are attached or 
at  https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/tefap-ffcra-allocation-
worksheet   

The Coronavirus Aid, Relief, and Economic Security (CARES) Act provided a further 
$450 million.  Allocations to states are attached or 
at https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/2020-tefap-cares-allocation-
worksheet  

  

Program Description: 

The Emergency Food Assistance Program (TEFAP) is a federal program that helps 
supplement the diets of low-income Americans, including elderly people, by providing 
them with emergency food assistance at no cost. Through TEFAP, the U.S. Department 
of Agriculture (USDA) purchases a variety of nutritious, high quality USDA Foods, and 
makes those foods available to State Distributing Agencies. The amount of food each 
state receives out of the total amount of food provided is based on the number of 
unemployed persons and the number of people with incomes below the poverty level in 
the state. States provide the food to local agencies that they have selected, usually food 
banks, which in turn distribute the food to local organizations, such as soup kitchens and 
food pantries that directly serve the public. States also provide the food to other types of 
local organizations, such as community action agencies, which distribute the foods 
directly to low-income households. These local organizations distribute USDA Foods to 
eligible recipients for household consumption or use them to prepare and serve meals in 
a congregate setting. Under TEFAP, states also receive administrative funds to support 
the storage and distribution of USDA Foods. These funds must, in part, be passed down 
to local agencies. TEFAP is administered at the federal level by the Food and Nutrition 
Service, an agency of the USDA. 

IA Relevant Programs: Feeding (MC/EA) 

State Allocations under the FFCRA and CARES Act are in PDFs attached to MAX-TRAX 
record. 

https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19 
https://www.fns.usda.gov/tefap/emergency-food-assistance-program 
https://www.fns.usda.gov/csfp/commodity-supplemental-food-program 
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/tefap-ffcra-allocation-worksheet 
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/2020-tefap-cares-allocation-
worksheet 
https://www.fns.usda.gov/tefap/covid-19-qas 

https://www.fns.usda.gov/tefap/tefap-fact-sheet 

Total Program Funding: $850,000,000 

Max Award: $102,123,420 (California) 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Individuals & Households, Local Government & Authority, 
Nonprofit Organizations, State, Territory States and Territories for distribution to: 
(A). Public or private nonprofit organizations that provide nutrition assistance to low-
income Americans, either through the distribution of food for home use or the 

https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/tefap-ffcra-allocation-worksheet
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/tefap-ffcra-allocation-worksheet
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/2020-tefap-cares-allocation-worksheet
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/2020-tefap-cares-allocation-worksheet
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19
https://www.fns.usda.gov/tefap/emergency-food-assistance-program
https://www.fns.usda.gov/csfp/commodity-supplemental-food-program
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/tefap-ffcra-allocation-worksheet
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/2020-tefap-cares-allocation-worksheet
https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19/2020-tefap-cares-allocation-worksheet
https://www.fns.usda.gov/tefap/covid-19-qas
https://www.fns.usda.gov/tefap/tefap-fact-sheet
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preparation of meals, may receive food as local agencies. They must also meet the 
following criteria: Organizations that distribute food for home use must determine 
household eligibility by applying income standards set by the State. Organizations that 
provide prepared meals must demonstrate that they serve predominately low-income 
persons.  
(B). Households that meet State eligibility criteria may receive food for home use. States 
set income standards, which may, at the State’s discretion, be met through participation 
in other existing Federal, State, or local food, health, or welfare programs for which 
eligibility is based on income. States can adjust eligibility criteria to ensure that 
assistance is provided only to those households most in need.  
(C). Recipients of prepared meals are low-income and are not subject to a means test.  
 
States pass food and funding to selected organizations that meet the definition of 
TEFAP eligible recipient agency found at 7 CFR 251 3(d).  Agencies provide food to 
eligible participants who meet certain income and residency standards set by the State.   

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: Yes. 40% of administrative funds must be passed through to emergency 
feeding organizations.  Administrative funds kept at the State level must be matched 
dollar-for-dollar. 

Reference Link: https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19 
 

R18. CARES Act: FY20 Runaway & Homeless Youth (RHY) - Transitional Living 

Program (TLP) (93.550) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Health and Human Services 

Funding Type: Supplemental 

Program Description : The Purpose of FYSB’s Transitional Living Program (TLP) for 
Older Homeless Youth grant program is to implement, enhance, and/or support effective 
strategies for successful transition to sustainable living for runaway and homeless youth 
ages 16 to under 22 and/or pregnant and parenting youth ages 16 to under 22 and their 
dependent child(ren).   

TLP supports projects that provide long-term residential services to homeless 
youth.  Living accommodations may include: 

• Host-family homes; 

• Group homes or maternity group homes; and/or 

• Supervised apartments owned by the program or rented in the community. 

Projects must provide safe, stable, and appropriate shelter for up to 18 months, which 
under extenuating circumstances, can be extended to 21 months and provide 
comprehensive services that supports the transition of homeless youth to self-sufficiency 
and stable, independent living. Through the provision of shelter and an array of 
comprehensive services, TLPs offer or refer for the following services: 

• Safe, stable living accommodations; 

https://www.fns.usda.gov/disaster/pandemic/covid-19
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• Basic life skills building - including consumer education, budgeting, 
housekeeping, food preparation and parenting skills; 

• Educational opportunities - such as GED preparation, post-secondary training, 
and vocational education; 

• Job attainment services - such as career counseling and job placement; 

• Mental health care - including individual and group counseling; and 

• Physical health care - such as physicals, health assessments, and emergency 
treatment. 

CARES Act supplemental funding may be used for costs incurred on or after March 27, 
2020 to prevent, prepare for, and respond to, COVID-19. CARES Act supplemental 
funding must be used to supplement, not supplant, existing funds.  The matching 
requirements for the supplemental funds are waived.  There must be a separate tracking 
mechanism in place for the CARES Act supplemental funds. 

Total Program Funding: $12,501,171 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations, 
Public/Indian Housing Authorities, Public/Private Institutions of Education K-12, 
Public/Private Institutions of Higher Education, State, Territory, Tribe Special district 
governments; Public and State controlled institutions of higher education; Nonprofits 
having a 501(c)(3) status with the IRS, other than institutions of higher education; Native 
American tribal organizations (other than Federally recognized tribal governments); 
Nonprofits that do not have a 501(c)(3) status with the IRS, other than institutions of 
higher education; Private institutions of higher education; Native American tribal 
governments (Federally recognized); County governments; City or township 
governments; Public housing authorities/Indian housing authorities; State governments; 
Others; Independent school districts. 
 
Faith-based and community organizations that meet the eligibility requirements are 
eligible to receive awards under this funding opportunity announcement.  Private 
institutions of higher education must be nonprofit entities. 
 
The Secretary is authorized to make grants to provide technical assistance to public and 
nonprofit private entities and coordinate networks of such entities to establish and 
operate transitional living youth projects for homeless youth.  In selecting eligible 
applicants to receive grants under this FOA, priority will be given to applicants who have 
experience in providing shelter and services to homeless youth as required by the 
Runaway and Homeless Youth (RHY) Act. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Supplemental award recipients must provide a brief narrative (1-2 
pages) describing how funds have been or will be used to support activities to prevent, 
prepare for, and respond to, COVID-19.  Provide the completed SF-424A budget form 
and the associated budget narrative. 
 
As stated in notice of award, you should submit information through GrantSolutions 
within 30 days of supplemental award date. 
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Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: https://www.acf.hhs.gov/ohsepr 
 

R19. CARES Act: FY20-24 Indian Community Development Block Grants (14.862) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Housing and Urban Development 

Funding Type: Supplemental 

Program Description : ICDBG allocations coming soon.  

Program Purpose: Provides $100 million to prevent, prepare for, and respond to 
coronavirus, including to maintain normal operations and fund eligible affordable housing 
activities under NAHASDA during the period that the program is impacted by 
coronavirus. 

Eligible activities include: 

• Construction of permanent or temporary facilities for testing, diagnosis, or 
treatment of COVID-19. 

• Construction of permanent or temporary facilities for testing, diagnosis, or 
treatment of COVID-19. 

• Acquisition, rehabilitation, or construction of a group living facility that may be 
used to centralize patients undergoing treatment. 

• Retrofitting of a food bank to ensure that employees and volunteers can safely 
work in the facility and distribute food. 

• Construction or conversion of structures that can serve as temporary emergency 
shelters to shelter homeless persons and minimize risk of community spread. 

• Purchase of emergency ambulances and related specialized equipment and 
tools to expand medical and other emergency services. 

• Expanding cell towers and broadband infrastructure capacity needed to assist 
communities lacking internet and phone service to conduct business, allow 
students to participate in distance learning,support telehealth strategies, and 
provide other community services, provided such activities can be carried out 
expeditiously. 

• Rental assistance. 

• Job training 

• Purchasing groceries for a food bank or distribution to vulnerable individuals. 

• Providing security to ensure the health and safety of community members and to 
secure construction sites and community facilities from theft or vandalism. 

• Testing, diagnosis or other services at a fixed or mobile location. 

Up to 20 percent may be expended for planning and management development and 
administration.  May be used to cover or reimburse allowable costs to prevent, prepare 
for, and respond to coronavirus incurred by a recipient, including for costs incurred prior 

https://www.acf.hhs.gov/ohsepr
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to the date of enactment of this Act.  Waives the limitation on for public services activities 
to prevent, prepare for, and respond to coronavirus. 

IA Relevant Programs: Financial Housing Assistance (IHP) 

https://www.hud.gov/program_offices/public_indian_housing/ih/Covid_Recovery 
https://www.hud.gov/sites/dfiles/PIH/documents/PIH2020-11.pdf 

 

Total Program Funding: $100,000,000 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Public/Indian Housing Authorities, Tribe Native American 
tribes in need of funding to maintain normal operations and fund eligible affordable 
housing activities under NAHASDA. 
 
  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: See Implementation Notice attached.  Applications must be sent to 
ICDBGCARES@hud.gov. Applications shall not be sent via regular mail given that HUD 
is operating under mandatory telework at the present time. As a result, applications sent 
via regular mail will not be considered. After sending their applications to 
ICDBGCARES@hud.gov, applicants should maintain the original application with wet 
signatures in their files. Do not submit ICDBG-CARES applications through 
www.grants.gov. ICDBG-CARES applications sent to the Area ONAP will not be date 
stamped and applicants will be redirected to submit their 
application to ICDBGCARES@hud.gov. 
 
The Office of Native American Programs (ONAP) will begin accepting applications on 
Monday, June 1st at 3PM Eastern Time. Applications submitted before this time will not 
be considered and must be resubmitted after the Monday, June 1st at 3PM Eastern 
Time opening date and time. 
 
 

Cost Share: Not Identified. "For ICDBG/ICDBG-CARES, the program statute does 
expressly allow for the use of ICDBG funds to meet cost share requirement in other 
programs.  CDBG has been used to meet FEMA cost share in the disaster context, but 
the catch is that the CDBG funds must still be used in accordance with CDBG/ICDBG 
requirements.  They don’t become FEMA funds subject to FEMA PA requirements.  
Here the statutory provision.  Section 105 of the Housing and Community Development 
Act lists this as an eligible ICDBG activity: “payment of the non-Federal share required in 
connection with a Federal grant-in-aid program undertaken as part of activities assisted 
under this chapter” 
 
IHBG/IHBG-CARES takes the same approach: 
24 CFR §1000.122    
Question: May NAHASDA grant funds be used as matching funds to obtain and leverage 
funding, including any Federal or state program and still be considered an affordable 
housing activity? 

https://www.hud.gov/program_offices/public_indian_housing/ih/Covid_Recovery
https://www.hud.gov/sites/dfiles/PIH/documents/PIH2020-11.pdf
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Answer: There is no prohibition in NAHASDA against using grant funds as matching 
funds." 

Reference Link: 
https://www.hud.gov/program_offices/public_indian_housing/ih/Covid_Recovery 

 

R20. Families First Coronavirus Response Act:  FY20-21 Aging & Disability 

Nutrition Services Programs 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Department of Health and Human Services 

Funding Type: Supplemental 

Program Description : The Families First Coronavirus Response Act, signed into law by 
President Trump on March 18, 2020, provided the additional funding for the nutrition 
services programs authorized by the Older Americans Act (OAA) of 1965.  These 
programs provide meals to more than 2.4 million older adults each year, both through 
home delivery and in places like community centers.  The need for these services, 
particularly home-delivered and packaged meals, has increased as community 
measures to slow transmission of COVID-19 have closed meal sites and have left many 
family caregivers unable to assist their older loved ones.  

In addition to meals, Older Americans Act programs provide a wide range of services, 
such as help with bathing and dressing, rides to doctors’ offices, education on managing 
chronic illnesses, support for family caregivers, and much more.  Provided by a network 
of community-based organizations, such as Area Agencies on Aging, local community 
and senior centers, faith-based organizations, and other nonprofit service providers, 
these programs work together to help millions of older adults each year stay healthy and 
continue living independently. 

$250 million has been allocated to States and Tribal organizations. See reference links 
or attachments for allocation tables. 

• $160 million for Home-Delivered Nutrition Services; 

• $80 million for Congregate Nutrition Services; and 

• $10 million Nutrition Services for Native Americans. 

Grant amounts are determined based on the population-based formulas defined in the 
Older Americans Act. 

https://acl.gov/news-and-events/announcements/hhs-announces-grants-provide-meals-
older-adults 

https://acl.gov/programs/health-wellness/nutrition-services 

Total Program Funding: $250,000,000 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: State, Territory, Tribe State, Tribal and Territorial Units on 
Aging, for distribution to Aging and Disability Services Programs including Federal/SLTT 
partnerships for subsequent allocation to local meal providers. 
|Eligibility for these programs is determined almost entirely by states and local entities. 
The only federal eligibility criteria for participation is age – a person must be at least 60 
years old to participate in either the congregate or home-delivered nutrition programs.| 

https://www.hud.gov/program_offices/public_indian_housing/ih/Covid_Recovery
https://acl.gov/news-and-events/announcements/hhs-announces-grants-provide-meals-older-adults
https://acl.gov/news-and-events/announcements/hhs-announces-grants-provide-meals-older-adults
https://acl.gov/programs/health-wellness/nutrition-services
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In addition, Section 339 of the Older Americans Act expands eligibility to spouses (of any 
age) of older adults, and creates the option for programs to offer meals to the following: 
 
• People who provide volunteer services during meal hours 
 • People with disabilities who live in housing facilities where mainly older adults live and 
which also provide congregate nutrition services 
 • People with disabilities who reside with eligible older adults 
 • Spouses (of any age) of people age 60 or older | 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: No. State matching requirements under sections 304(d)(1)(D) and 309(b)(2) 
of the OAA shall not apply. 

Reference Link: https://acl.gov/news-and-events/announcements/hhs-announces-
grants-provide-meals-older-adults 

 

R21. Farm Loan Programs 

Resource Type: Loan  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : Farm Service Agency (FSA)'s Farm Loan Programs provide 
access to credit. Some of the opportunities programs offer to family-sized farmers and 
ranchers:  

• Start, improve, expand, transition, market and strengthen family farming & 
ranching operations 

• Beginning farmers, racial & ethnic minority farmers & women producers 

• Value-added, direct sale, organic, & specialty crop operations 

FSA loan types include the following: 

Farm Ownership loans help you purchase or enlarge a farm or ranch, construct a new 
or improve an existing farm or ranch building, pay closing costs, and pay for soil and 
water conservation and protection. 

Operating loans help you purchase livestock and equipment and pay for minor real 
estate repairs and annual operating expenses. 

Microloans are direct farm ownership and operating loans with a shortened application 
process and reduced paperwork designed to meet the needs of smaller, non-traditional, 
and niche-type operations. 

Emergency loans help you if you suffered a qualifying loss caused by natural disasters 
that damaged your farm or ranch. Emergency loan funds may be used to restore or 
replace essential property, pay all or part of production costs associated with the 
disaster year, pay essential family living expenses, reorganize the farming operation, 
and refinance certain debts. 

https://acl.gov/news-and-events/announcements/hhs-announces-grants-provide-meals-older-adults
https://acl.gov/news-and-events/announcements/hhs-announces-grants-provide-meals-older-adults
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EZ Guarantee loans are guaranteed farm ownership and operating loans with a 
shortened application process and reduced paperwork designed to meet the needs of 
smaller, non-traditional, and niche-type operations. 

Conservation loans help you complete a conservation practice in an approved 
conservation plan. 

Land contract guarantees provide certain financial guarantees to the seller of a farm or 
ranch through a land contract sale to a beginning or socially disadvantaged farmer or 
rancher. The seller may request either of the following: 

• Prompt Payment Guarantee: A guarantee up to the amount of three amortized 
annual installments plus the cost of any related real 
estate taxes and insurance. The seller must choose a third-party escrow agent 
who will handle transactions related to the contract. 

• Standard Guarantee: A guarantee of 90 percent of the outstanding principal 
balance under the land contract. The seller must choose a third-party servicing 
agent. 

Highly Fractionated Indian Land Loans provide a way for tribes, tribal members, and 
tribal entities to purchase fractionated interests through intermediary lenders. 

Program Webpage: 
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-programs/index 

Your Guide to FSA Farm Loans:  
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Assets/USDA-FSA-Public/usdafiles/Farm-Loan-
Programs/pdfs/your_guide_to_farm_loans.pdf 

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Agricultural Producers, For-Profit Organizations, 
Individuals & Households Farmers and Ranchers 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: Yes.  

Reference Link: https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-
programs/index 

 

R22. Environmental Quality Incentive Program (EQIP) (10.912) 

Resource Type: Technical Assistance  

Agency/Organization: Department of Agriculture 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : Environmental Quality Incentives Program (EQIP): Farmers, 
ranchers, and non-industrial private forestland owners can apply for resource assistance 
through the Environmental Quality Incentives Program .  Eligible land includes cropland, 
rangeland, pastureland, environmentally sensitive areas, other ranch lands, and non-

https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-programs/index
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Assets/USDA-FSA-Public/usdafiles/Farm-Loan-Programs/pdfs/your_guide_to_farm_loans.pdf
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/Assets/USDA-FSA-Public/usdafiles/Farm-Loan-Programs/pdfs/your_guide_to_farm_loans.pdf
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-programs/index
https://www.fsa.usda.gov/programs-and-services/farm-loan-programs/index
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/main/national/programs/financial/eqip
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industrial private forestland. Recovery assistance includes but is not limited to: 
immediate soil erosion protection, minimizing noxious and invasive plant proliferation, 
protecting water quality, restoring livestock infrastructure necessary for grazing 
management, emergency animal mortality management.  

EQIP includes Emergency Animal Morality Management: When catastrophic non-
disease natural events (ie. flood, fire, weather-related) occur, financial assistance for 
emergency animal mortality management may be offered. Producers can contact the 
local field office for details. 

Program webpage: 
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detail/national/programs/financial/eqip/?cid=n
rcseprd1342638 

• EQIP Disaster Recovery Assistance 

• Ayuda Para La Recuperación Ante Desastres Naturales A Través Del EQIP 

• Disaster Recovery Assistance | NRCS (usda.gov): 
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detailfull/national/programs/?cid=nrcs
eprd1361073  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Agricultural Producers, Individuals & Households, Tribe 
Agricultural producers who face serious threats to soil, water, and related natural 
resources, or who need assistance with complying with Federal and State environment 
laws. A participant may be an owner, landlord, operator, or tenant of eligible agricultural 
lands or non-industrial forestlands. Limited resource producers, small-scale producers, 
social disadvantaged individuals, federally recognized Indian tribal governments, Alaska 
natives, and Pacific Islanders are encouraged to apply. 
 
Restrictions - Cost: Conservation practices may be eligible for conservation payments up 
to 75 percent of the total cost of establishing the practice, including costs of foregone 
income. Limited resource producers, social disadvantaged producers, and beginning 
farmers/ranchers may be eligible for payments up to 90 percent of the approved practice 
cost. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: How to apply: 
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detail/national/programs/financial/eqip/?cid=n
rcseprd1342638 
Contact your local NRCS field office for more information: 
https://offices.sc.egov.usda.gov/locator/app?agency=nrcs 
Program site: 
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/main/national/programs/financial/eqip/ 
PDF: https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/Internet/FSE_MEDIA/nrcseprd1429025.pdf 

Cost Share: No. Socially disadvantaged, beginning and limited resource farmers, Indian 
Tribes and beginning farmers/veterans are eligible for an increased payment rate and 
may receive advance payment of up to 50 percent to purchase materials and services 
needed to implement conservation practices included in their EQIP contract. 

https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detail/national/programs/financial/eqip/?cid=nrcseprd1342638
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detail/national/programs/financial/eqip/?cid=nrcseprd1342638
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/Internet/FSE_MEDIA/nrcseprd1429025.pdf
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/PA_NRCSConsumption/download?cid=nrcseprd1366611&ext=pdf
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detailfull/national/programs/?cid=nrcseprd1361073
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detailfull/national/programs/?cid=nrcseprd1361073
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Reference Link: 
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detail/national/programs/financial/eqip/?cid=n
rcseprd1342638 
 

Philanthropic Resources 
 

R1. FY23 Zayed Sustainability Prize 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Program Description : The Zayed Sustainability Prize, an evolution of the Zayed Future 
Energy Prize, is the UAE’s pioneering global award in sustainability and a tribute to the 
legacy of the late founding father of the UAE, Sheikh Zayed bin Sultan Al Nahyan.  

Established in 2008, this annual award recognizes and rewards the achievements of 
those who are driving impactful, innovative and inspiring sustainability solutions across 
five distinct categories: Health, Food, Energy, Water and Global High Schools. 

• Health 

• Food 

• Energy 

• Water 

• Global High Schools 

At the 2008 World Future Energy Summit, H.H. Sheikh Mohamed bin Zayed Al Nahyan, 
Crown Prince of Abu Dhabi and Deputy Supreme Commander of the UAE Armed 
Forces, announced the launch of the Zayed Future Energy Prize – a tribute to his father, 
the late Sheikh Zayed bin Sultan Al Nahyan, and his sustainability legacy. 

By recognizing pioneering solutions and technologies that can change the world, the 
Zayed Sustainability Prize, has rewarded innovators and visionaries whose 
achievements have furthered the global proliferation of innovative, impactful and 
inspirational sustainability solutions. 

Over 352 million people have been directly or indirectly impacted by the sustainability 
solutions and school projects of the 86 recipients of the Prize winners since the first 
awards ceremony in 2009. 

Winners: Zayed Sustainability Prize 

June 2021 Press Release: Zayed Sustainability Prize 

 

Total Program Funding: $3,000,000 

Max Award: $600,000 - $3,000,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: For-Profit Organizations, Nonprofit Organizations To be 
eligible for this prize, you should be a small or medium-sized enterprise, a social 
enterprise, a non-governmental organization (NGO), a non-profit organization (NPO), or 
a similar organization (with revenues of less than $50m per year). 

Application Deadline: Jul-06-2022 

https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detail/national/programs/financial/eqip/?cid=nrcseprd1342638
https://www.nrcs.usda.gov/wps/portal/nrcs/detail/national/programs/financial/eqip/?cid=nrcseprd1342638
https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/health
https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/food
https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/energy
https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/water
https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/global-high-schools
https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/winners/winners
https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/news/news-folder/2022-cos-press-release
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Application Process: How to Apply: https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/how-to-
apply 
Health: https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/health 
Food: https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/food 
Energy: https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/energy 
Water: https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/water 
Global High Schools:  
https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/categories/global-high-schools 
FAQ: https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/apply/faq 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/Apply/How-to-Apply 
 

R2. First Nations Development Institute - COVID-19 Emergency Response 

Resource Type: In Kind  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The COVID-19 Emergency Response Fund is designed to 
distribute funds efficiently and swiftly to Native nonprofit organizations and tribal 
programs that need it most. Initially, funds are being prioritized in high-concentration 
areas – California, New Mexico, the Pacific Northwest, New York, Navajo Nation, Hopi 
Tribe and COVID-19 hot-spots.  

Issue areas: Food assistance and hunger relief; Food distribution/distributors 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations, Tribe  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: These grants are being distributed without an application process. 
Donations to the Emergency Fund are being passed through without administrative fees. 
100% of donations are going directly to Native communities. 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://www.firstnations.org/coronavirus/ 
 

R3. GENYOUth COVID-19 Emergency School Meal Delivery & End Student 

Hunger Fund 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Program Description : GENYOUth is providing grants of up to $3,000 per school to 
supply much-needed resources for meal distribution and delivery efforts to get food to 
students during COVID-19. From soft-sided coolers, bags and containers for individual 
servings, to protective gear for food service sanitation and safety, this equipment will 
help ensure our children continue to receive the nutritious meals they need.  

End Student Hunger Fund (genyouthnow.org) 

https://zayedsustainabilityprize.com/en/Apply/How-to-Apply
https://www.firstnations.org/coronavirus/
https://covid-19.genyouthnow.org/
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Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: $3,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Public/Private Institutions of Education K-12 * School 
must be located in the United States 
 * School must participate in the National School Lunch Program 
 * School must include at least one of the grades K-12 
 * School must be located in a recognized “brick and mortar” school building 
 
Application may be submitted by: 
 * School Principals 
 * School Nutrition Managers 
 * School Nutrition Directors 
 * District Superintendents 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Each application is for a single school to apply. If multiple schools 
from a school district would like to apply, a separate application is required for each 
school. Application: https://covid-19.genyouthnow.org/pdf/Application%20COVID-
19%20Emergency%20School%20Meal%20Delivery%20Fund.pdf 
Schools must participate in the National School Lunch Program and include at least one 
of the grades K-12. 
 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://covid-19.genyouthnow.org/ 
 

R4. Mission Asset Fund - Immigrant Families Fund (Rolling Deadline) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Program Description : The Immigrant Families Fund provides grants of $500 to 
immigrants to help cover whatever is most pressing in their lives. In order to be eligible, 
applicants must have experienced an income disruption due to COVID-19, earn less 
than $99,000 or have a household income of less than $198,000, and not be eligible to 
receive a CARES Recovery Rebate (coronavirus stimulus check) from the Federal 
government.  

Applications are reviewed on a rolling basis. 

Program webpage: 
https://missionassetfund.org/immigrant-families-grant/ 

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: $500 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Individuals & Households ELIGIBILITY 
REQUIREMENTS: 
* Not eligible to receive a CARES Recovery Rebate (coronavirus stimulus check) from 
the Federal government. 

https://covid-19.genyouthnow.org/
https://missionassetfund.org/immigrant-families-grant/
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* Earned less than $99,000 or total household income below $198,000 in 2019. 
* Experienced an income disruption due to the coronavirus (COVID-19) pandemic. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Step 1:  PRE-APPLY – Submit a pre-application today 
(https://maf.force.com/lendingcircles/PreApplicationImmigrantCVD19). 
 
Step 2:  APPLY – Depending on eligibility, equity, and available funding, we may invite 
you to submit a full grant application.  If you are invited, you will receive an email from 
MAF inviting you to submit your full application in our secure portal. 
 
Step 3:  APPROVAL – If we approve your application, we will deposit a $500 grant 
directly into your bank account within 2-5 business days. 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://missionassetfund.org/immigrant-families-grant/ 
 

R5. Sustainable Agriculture & Food Systems Funders 

Resource Type: Grant and Cooperative Agreement  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Program Description : Sustainable Agriculture and Food Systems Funders (SAFSF) 
amplifies the impact of philanthropic and investment communities in support of 
just and sustainable food and agriculture systems.  

SAFSF is a vibrant and growing affinity group (also known as a philanthropic support 
organization) for philanthropic grantmakers and mission-based investors that have an 
interest in just and sustainable food and agriculture systems. Our organizational 
members include community and corporate foundations, private foundations, 
government agencies, health conversion foundations, investment organizations, 
individual donors and investors, and more. SAFSF members make investments at local, 
regional, state, Tribal, national, and international levels to support activities and 
strategies related to justice, farms and farming systems, environmental sustainability, 
markets, health, agricultural products, and much more within the food system. 

SAFSF’s programming and work is guided by our strategic agenda. Our vision, mission, 
and values define who we are. They provide the fundamental structure for the 
organization. They guide our actions and our behaviors. They influence the way we work 
within the organization and with others. 

VISION: All resources invested in food and agriculture systems enhance our collective 
well-being. 

General Resources: http://www.safsf.org/resources/ 

COVID-19: http://www.safsf.org/resources/covid19-funds/ 

Policy: http://www.safsf.org/2020policy/ 

  

  

 

https://missionassetfund.org/immigrant-families-grant/
http://www.safsf.org/who/members/
http://www.safsf.org/who/members/
http://www.safsf.org/wp-content/uploads/2019/07/SAFSF_StrategicAgenda_OnePage_Final_Revised_2019.pdf
http://www.safsf.org/resources/
http://www.safsf.org/resources/covid19-funds/
http://www.safsf.org/2020policy/
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Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Agricultural Producers, For-Profit Organizations, 
Nonprofit Organizations, Tribe  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: http://www.safsf.org/resources/ 
 

R6. Presbyterian Committee on the Self-Development of People - COVID-19 

Grant Program (Rolling Deadline) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Program Description : The Presbyterian Committee on the Self-Development of People 
participates in the empowerment of economically poor, oppressed, and disadvantaged 
people who are seeking to change the structures that perpetuate poverty, oppression, 
and injustice.  

While each project and community with whom SDOP partners is unique and varied, we 
have developed a set of program measures to cohesively tell the story and impact of our 
combined work. SDOP partners are asked to consider and report how their work 
contributes to these measures, both quantitatively and qualitatively. Projects are not 
expected to demonstrate progress in all of the measure areas or even in each of the 
examples provided. Instead, each project will report what resonates with the results of 
their work. Program measures include the following: 

• Develop diverse leadership/membership/engagement includes counts of 
participants involved in leadership activities, their diversity and the degree of 
engagement. 

• Realize social justice achievements includes justice measures that build power 
for the economically poor and oppressed. This can be measured, for example, in 
changes in policy, transformation of unjust practices, increased independence 
and increased representation. 

• Strengthen relationships, communication and collaboration includes counts of 
outreach activities into the community and the partnerships formed or 
strengthened. 

• Expand education and skills development includes counts for the number and 
types of trainings and technical assistance. 

• Increase economic development opportunities includes the reporting of activities 
related to strengthening economic opportunities for group members. 

• Enhance quality of life includes measures of change and improvement across a 
broad spectrum of issues including health, housing, food security, transportation, 
safety, etc. 

Total Program Funding: $110,000 

http://www.safsf.org/resources/
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Max Award: $7,500 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations 
Limited SDOP COVID-19 funding available for community organizations/groups (not 
individuals) in the United States working with low income communities. 
 
Groups currently being funded by SDOP (National and Mid-Council/Local level) are 
ineligible to apply for the COVID-19 funding. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Partnerships are initiated by applications to the Presbyterian 
Committee on the Self-Development of People (SDOP) and are evaluated using SDOP’s 
funding criteria and overarching SDOP program measures. 
 
Use the application template provided online, save a copy of the word document, and 
email it to clara.nunez@pcusa.org.  
 
Three letters of recommendation from established community leaders and/or established 
organizations to demonstrate the group’s work experience are required with each 
application (i.e. local government persons, persons at Community Foundations, Pastors, 
Bank representatives, local church, United Way, Salvation Army, a well-established 
community organization, etc.).  The letters must be on letterhead. 
 
There are no deadlines.  The review process might take up to 6 months. 
 

Cost Share:   

Reference Link: https://www.presbyterianmission.org/ministries/sdop/apply-grant/ 
 

R7. FY22 Clif Bar Family Foundation - Small Grants Program 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The Clif Bar Family Foundation is offering grants through the 
Small Grants Program to nonprofit grassroots organizations that have the ability to 
engage local groups, positively impact their communities, and focus most of their 
resources on useful and positive actions. Through the Small Grants Program, the 
Foundation supports innovative small and mid-sized groups working to:  

• Protect the Earth’s beauty and bounty; 

• Create a robust, healthy food system; 

• Increase opportunities for outdoor activity; 

• Reduce environmental health hazards; and 

• Build stronger communities. 

Over the years, the Foundation has been proud to support hundreds of organizations 
that are working tirelessly to conserve wild places and open spaces, advocate for 
pedestrian- and bike-friendly communities, and expand urban forests and restore 

https://www.presbyterianmission.org/ministries/sdop/apply-grant/
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watersheds. These nonprofits often are on the front lines, striving to safeguard public 
health and the environment by expanding organic farming acreage, improving local and 
global food security, investigating the impact of environmental toxins, and tackling the 
root causes of climate change. 

Grants are awarded for general organizational support, as well as funding for specific 
projects. Areas not funded include: 

• Individuals 

• State agencies 

• Religious groups 

• Seminar, media, or fundraising events (e.g., "Fun Runs") that are not an integral 
part of a broader program 

• Capital construction 

• Endowment funds 

• Deficit funding 

• For national organizations with local chapters, we may fund either the national 
organization OR a local chapter located nearby our offices. 

Applications are reviewed three times per year; the application deadlines are February 1, 
June 1, and October 1, annually. 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations U.S.-based 501(c)(3) 
organizations (or groups with a 501(c)(3) fiscal sponsor) are eligible for our small grants 
programs.  

Application Deadline: Jun-01-2022 

Application Process: Visit the Foundation’s website to learn more about the Small Grants 
Program; to take the eligibility quiz click on Apply for a Grant at top of page. Applications 
reviewed three times per year; application deadlines are Feb 1, June 1, & Oct 1, 
annually. https://cliffamilyfoundation.org/grants-program 
 
 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://cliffamilyfoundation.org/grants-program 
 

R8. GlobalGiving - California Wildfire Relief Fund [California] 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Program Description : All donations to this fund will support relief and recovery efforts for 
Californians affected by the 2020 wildfires. Initially, the fund will help first responders 
meet survivors' immediate needs for food, fuel, clean water, medicine, and shelter. The 
fund will transition to support longer-term recovery efforts run by local, vetted 

https://cliffamilyfoundation.org/grants-program
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organizations in the region. We monitor the impact on affected communities and work 
with partners on the ground to allocate funds to where they're needed most.  

California is battling wildfires at a historic scale this season. A heat wave and lightning 
sparked the second-largest fire in the state's history in late August 2020, with hundreds 
of smaller fires burning across multiple counties. Homes have been destroyed and more 
than 100,000 residents are displaced. The COVID-19 pandemic is an added challenge 
for first responders and residents, with the threat of infection remaining high, particularly 
in shelters where social distancing is challenging. 

Total Program Funding: $5,000,000 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Agricultural Producers, For-Profit Organizations, 
Healthcare Institution, Individuals & Households, Local Government & Authority, 
Nonprofit Organizations, Public/Indian Housing Authorities, Public/Private Institutions of 
Education K-12, Public/Private Institutions of Higher Education, State, Territory, Tribe 
Californians affected by the 2020 wildfires. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: They monitor the impact on affected communities and work with 
partners on the ground to allocate funds to where they're needed most. GlobalGiving will 
post reports about how funds have been used and will email these reports to donors. 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://www.globalgiving.org/projects/california-wildfire-relief-fund/ 
 

R9. Silicon Valley Community Foundation - Regional Nonprofit Emergency 

Fund 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : Funds from SVCF’s COVID-19 Coronavirus Regional Response 
Fund will support lead organizations representing each of the nine Bay Area counties 
and their immediate efforts in addressing COVID-19 related challenges in their 
respective counties.  

Operating grants for nonprofit organizations that have experienced unexpected costs 
due the COVID-19 pandemic. These costs could include, but are not limited to, the 
following: 
•Increased sick days or other benefits needed for staff impacted by the illness 
•Meeting or event cancelations 
•Supplies related to health and hygiene (e.g., masks, gowns, gloves and other protective 
equipment) as recommended by the Centers for Disease Control or county public health 
departments 
•Technology upgrades or purchase of virtual communication vehicles 
•For schools, items needed for distance learning (computers, wi-fi hotspots, etc.) or 
supplies that support food distribution for low-income students 
• Other operational costs related to shifts in direct service plans or the provision of 
emergency services 

https://www.globalgiving.org/projects/california-wildfire-relief-fund/
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Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations Organizations with a 501c (3) 
designation. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: For San Mateo and Santa Clara nonprofits, please complete this 
application and email it to NPemergencyfund@siliconvalleycf.org. 
As of July 2020, applicants will be waitlisted due to a low availability of funds. 
 
We welcome organizations interested in applying for Silicon Valley Strong funding. 
Please note, organizations that have already received grant funding from the Silicon 
Valley Community Foundation Nonprofit Emergency Fund will not eligible to apply for 
SVStrong funding. Thank you for your understanding. It is our hope to be able to reach 
as many organizations as possible serving our most vulnerable communities. These are 
challenging times and we appreciate your efforts to support the communities we serve. 
 

Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: https://www.siliconvalleycf.org/coronavirus-fund 
 

R10. East Bay Community Foundation [California] 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The Fund will provide one-time general operating grants to 
organizations that provide critical services around economic security to the most 
vulnerable populations in the East Bay. These organizations are focused on providing 
immediate, mid-term, and long-term support related to: Loss of employment and 
decreased hourly work, resulting in reduced income; Closures of schools and childcare 
centers (resulting in lost earnings as parents must take time off to care for children); 
Increased healthcare costs for testing and treatment, and loss of income as individuals 
are forced to take time off for self-care and to care for family members; Food insecurity 
resulting from lower individual and family income; Reduced access to a range of social 
services and programs, in response to social distancing requirements.  

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations EBCF’s COVID-19: A Just East 
Bay Response Fund will make grants to organizations that meet the following criteria: 
•501(c)(3) status or fiscally sponsored project. 
•Have a focus on the following priority populations: undocumented immigrants, 
unsheltered individuals, those employed via cash economy (e.g. day laborers, domestic 
workers), uninsured and under-insured, youth, victims of domestic violence, low-income 
seniors, and formerly incarcerated. 
•Whose work aligns with the four funding categories listed below. 
•EBCF will prioritize existing grantee partners for support from the COVID-19: A Just 

https://www.siliconvalleycf.org/coronavirus-fund
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East Bay Response Fund, and may consider additional organizations as funds become 
available 
 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: There is no Request for Proposals (RFP) or application process. 
EBCF, with input from our community partners, will select organizations on a rolling 
basis to support through this Fund. If you believe you qualify based on the criteria listed 
above, please contact us at: grantmaking@eastbaycf.org. Please do bear with us as we 
are facing a higher than normal volume of inquiries for support. We will make every effort 
possible to respond within 1 week. 
 
We continue to actively solicit feedback from our community partners about the biggest 
needs in Alameda and Contra Costa Counties. If you would like to share the needs and 
challenges that communities in your area are facing, please email us at: 
grantmaking@eastbaycf.org 
 

Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: https://www.ebcf.org/covid-19-fund/ 
 

R11. FarmLink - Ranch & Farm Loan Services [California] 

Resource Type: Loan  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : California Farmers and ranchers experiencing financial hardship 
because of COVID-19 may be eligible for loans of up to $20,000 at 0% interest, with no 
payments required for two years. Eligibility is largely based on repayment history and 
pre-COVID-19 income. Current and former borrowers will be prioritized. New borrowers 
are also eligible and encouraged to apply.  

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: $20,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Agricultural Producers, For-Profit Organizations, 
Territory, Tribe Farmers and Ranchers 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: Yes. Loans to be repaid with 0% interest, with no payments required for two 
years. 

Reference Link: https://www.californiafarmlink.org/covid-19-english/ 
 

R12. United Way Worldwide - COVID-19 Community Response & Recovery Fund 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

https://www.ebcf.org/covid-19-fund/
https://www.californiafarmlink.org/covid-19-english/
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Program Description : Supports communities by helping local United Ways respond, and 
by ensuring people get accurate information. Search local United Way funds here: 
https://www.unitedway.org/recovery/covid19/luw-
responses?utm_source=landingpage&utm_medium=web&utm_campagin=covid19  

"211, the go-to information resource in the U.S., is fielding 200-400% more calls than 
normal, mostly for food, financial assistance and housing. We expect as many calls for 
help in the next six months as we usually get in a full year." 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations Intended beneficiaries: 
Individuals and Households.  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Search local United Way funds here: 
https://www.unitedway.org/recovery/covid19/luw-
responses?utm_source=landingpage&utm_medium=web&utm_campagin=covid19 
 
FAQ: https://www.unitedway.org/recovery/covid19/faq 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://www.unitedway.org/recovery/covid19# 

 

R13. Native Americans in Philanthropy - Native American Community Response 

Fund 

Resource Type: In Kind  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : As Native American families turn to trusted community 
organizations for support and resources. These funds support Native American 
nonprofits on the ground who are caring for the most vulnerable populations – those 
facing food insecurity, access to housing, and low-income elderly.  

Native Americans in Philanthropy partner with the Decolonizing Wealth Project and the 
National Urban Indian Family Coalition in establishing a rapid response fund to provide 
emergency support for the most vulnerable Native American families and communities 
impacted by COVID-19. 

Issue areas: Food assistance and hunger relief 

  

https://nativephilanthropy.org/coronavirus-resource-center/ 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations, Tribe  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

https://www.unitedway.org/recovery/covid19/luw-responses?utm_source=landingpage&utm_medium=web&utm_campagin=covid19
https://www.unitedway.org/recovery/covid19/luw-responses?utm_source=landingpage&utm_medium=web&utm_campagin=covid19
https://www.unitedway.org/recovery/covid19
https://nativephilanthropy.org/coronavirus-resource-center/
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Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://nativephilanthropy.org/coronavirus-resource-center/ 
 

R14. Lyft - LyftUp COVID-19 Community Grants:  Essential Deliveries Program 

(Rolling Deadline) 

Resource Type: In Kind  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The LyftUp COVID-19 Community Grants program provides 
support to organizations in the U.S. as well as British Columbia and Ontario, Canada.  

Through the Essential Deliveries program, organizations that need delivery services for 
essential goods—such as groceries, medical supplies, auto parts, and home 
necessities—are matched with Lyft drivers, who can carry the deliveries out.  

Additionally, in collaboration with 500+ community partners, Lyft is helping provide 
essential services, including trips to the grocery store, pharmacy, healthcare 
appointments, etc., to those in need. Requests may be submitted at any time. 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: For-Profit Organizations, Healthcare Institution, 
Individuals & Households, Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations 
Applications may be submitted by the following entities:  Nonprofit; For-Profit Company; 
Healthcare; Elected Official; Transit/Government Agency; Foundation; 
Celebrity/Influencer; Individual; Other.   

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Complete and submit application online for consideration. 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: 
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLScUiTfWdML2vVHXxNcsooEPxLYNQ8SMN
3q4x8ICY8nszgR0Xw/viewform 

 

R15. Justice for Migrant Women -with- Hispanics in Philanthropy (HIP) - 

Farmworkers’ COVID-19 Pandemic Relief Fund 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : Justice for Migrant Women joined together with Hispanics In 
Philanthropy to raise immediate funds to help keep farmworker families safe from 
COVID-19 as they perform "essential" work to feed the nation.  Money will be received 
from this collective fund to help provide farmworker community members with much-
needed resources and goods to meet their basic needs.  

https://nativephilanthropy.org/coronavirus-resource-center/
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLScUiTfWdML2vVHXxNcsooEPxLYNQ8SMN3q4x8ICY8nszgR0Xw/viewform
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLScUiTfWdML2vVHXxNcsooEPxLYNQ8SMN3q4x8ICY8nszgR0Xw/viewform
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How will the funds be distributed? 
Partner organizations, such as the Coalition of Florida Farmworker Organizations (FL), 
East Coast Migrant Head Start Project (Multi-state), Farmworker Association of Florida 
(FL), The United Farm Workers Foundation (CA, WA), Pineros y Campesinos Unidos del 
Noreste (PCUN) (OR), Redlands Christian Migrant Association (RCMA) (FL), Pathstone 
Corporation (Multi-state), NC FIELD (NC), La Cooperativa Campesina de California 
(CA), Proteus, Inc. (CA), Student Action with Farmworkers (NC), Telamon Corporation 
(Multi-state), UMOS (WI, MN), La Union del Pueblo Entero (TX), Campesinos Sin 
Fronteras (AZ), Rural & Migrant Ministry (NY), League of United Latin American Citizens 
(LULAC) (PR), Centro de los Derechos del Migrante (MD), Farm Labor Organizing 
Committee (FLOC) (OH, NC), HOLA Ohio (OH), Community to Community Development 
(WA), and Idaho Organization of Resource Councils (ID) will receive money from this 
collective fund to help provide farmworker community members with much-needed 
resources and goods to meet their basic needs. 

  

Program webpage: 

https://justice4women.org/covid-19  

 

Total Program Funding: $1,500,000 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations, 
Territory, Tribe  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://justice4women.org/covid-19 
 

R16. Hispanics in Philanthropy (HIP) - The Essential Fund (to Support Latino 

Essential Workers) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The systemic shock of COVID-19 reveals the often-invisible 
essential services of Latino and Latin American immigrant workers across the country: 
from cultivating, processing, driving, stocking, and delivering food to our tables to caring, 
serving and offering other services in our homes, hospitals, schools, hotels, construction 
sites and clinics. The COVID-19 pandemic has deepened the economic and social 
disparities already impacting our Latino and immigrant communities—made up of mixed-
status, undocumented and multi-generational families.  

The Essential Fund will support Latino-led and Latino-serving organizations with close 
ties to essential workers in their efforts to focus on much-needed COVID-19 relief and 
recovery efforts. will be dedicated to resourcing communities with cash, food and rental 
assistance, personal protective equipment, child care, and other resources workers need 

https://justice4women.org/covid-19
https://justice4women.org/covid-19
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to continue providing essential services for our country as we flatten the curve. The Fund 
will award a minimum $1.6M USD. Grants awards will range from $10,000 USD to 
$50,000 USD based on track record of service provision, scale of work, and financial 
need of clients and families served. 

"The COVID-19 pandemic has revealed the often invisible and yet essential services 
provided by Latino and Latin American workers across the country and has deepened 
the economic and social disparities already impacting our communities. There are 
countless community leaders and organizations actively providing the first line of 
defense, building power and leadership in our communities, and ensuring our essential 
workers are safe and supported. This is why HIP has launched The Essential Fund." 

Proposals received prior to June 29th will be given priority; however organizations may 
still apply after that date. 

  

Organization website: 

https://hiponline.org/  

Program webpage: 

https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-
rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-
EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0
_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9  

 

Total Program Funding: $3,000,000 

Max Award: $50,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations, Territory, Tribe  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Online grant application here: 
https://form.jotform.com/201616329140951 
 
Project budget template: 
https://docs.google.com/spreadsheets/d/1cXZ44SmPsfX3Af3lHTHDAXDbrEqxO3MSzeh
SGSOyHNw/edit#gid=0 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-
rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-
EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0
_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9 

 

R17. Minority Freedom Community Fund 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

https://hiponline.org/
https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9
https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9
https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9
https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9
https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9
https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9
https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9
https://hiponline.org/essential-fund-rfp/?utm_source=Hispanics+in+Philanthropy+Newsletter&utm_campaign=cacd503620-EMAIL_CAMPAIGN_2018_12_13_04_34_COPY_01&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_e2bea9f04f-cacd503620-99198361&mc_cid=cacd503620&mc_eid=40b03fecb9
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Program Description : Mission: to improve the lives of minorities through economic 
support, social programs, and spiritual guidance.  

Fill out and submit this form to apply for emergency direct aid from the Minority Freedom 
Community Fund: https://form.jotform.com/200927370984058 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Individuals & Households, Nonprofit Organizations, 
Territory, Tribe  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: http://www.mifreedomcf.org/ 
 

R18. Salvation Army - Emergency Disaster Services 

Resource Type: Program Delivery  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : Disaster Relief Services:  
While each disaster creates its own unique circumstances and special needs, Salvation 
Army disaster relief efforts focus on seven core services. These services may be 
modified based on the magnitude of the disaster and adapted to meet the specific needs 
of individual survivors.  

1. Training: 
The first step in being ready to respond to an emergency is training. In partnership with 
other agencies, The Salvation Army’s disaster training program offers a variety of 
courses designed to help individuals and communities prepare for emergency events 
and become trained disaster volunteers. 

2. Food Service: 
When disaster strikes, one of the first signs that help is on the way is often the arrival of 
a Salvation Army mobile feeding unit, offering meals, snacks and drinks to rescue 
workers and survivors. 

3. Emotional and Spiritual Care: 
Motivated by Christian faith, The Salvation Army deploys specially trained individuals to 
offer emotional and spiritual care to rescue workers and disaster survivors. 

4. Emergency Communications: 
The Salvation Army Team Emergency Radio Network (SATERN) includes a worldwide 
network of volunteer amateur radio operators and other communications specialists, who 
may be mobilized to transmit emergency information during a disaster event. 

5. Disaster Social Services: 
After a family has lost everything in a disaster, The Salvation Army is there to provide 
emergency assistance to help meet survivors’ most urgent needs for food, clothing, 
shelter and medical services. 

https://form.jotform.com/200927370984058
http://www.mifreedomcf.org/
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6. Donations Management: 
The Salvation Army is one of the nation’s leaders in responsibly collecting, sorting and 
distributing donated goods. The Salvation Army encourages cash donations as the best 
and most flexible way to help and solicits only those in-kind donations which can be 
effectively received and efficiently distributed. 

7. Disaster Recovery: 
The Salvation Army supports long-term disaster recovery operations with flexible 
programming that is adaptable to the unique needs of individual communities. 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Individuals & Households, Local Government & Authority, 
Nonprofit Organizations  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: https://disaster.salvationarmyusa.org/ 
 

R19. Feeding America - COVID-19 Response 

Resource Type: Grant and Cooperative Agreement  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : Feeding America supports food banks nationwide (25 in FEMA 
Region IX) Feeding America has responded to the COVID-19 through the following: 
Launch of the COVID-19 Response Fund, a national food- and fund-raising effort to 
support people facing hunger and the food banks who help them. Work with government 
leaders to ensure the emergency response includes strong support and flexibility for 
federal nutrition programs including the School Lunch Program. Partnering with school 
districts and local government agencies to ensure that the 22 million children who rely on 
school meals have access to food outside of the classroom. Building an inventory of 
emergency food boxes to distribute to food banks across the country as the need for 
food assistance increases. Providing emergency grants to food banks to support local 
response efforts. Safely continuing our distribution of food and non-food and household 
items like cleaning supplies, diapers and personal care products.  

https://www.feedingamerica.org/  

https://www.feedingamerica.org/take-action/coronavirus  

https://www.walmart.com/cp/fight-hunger/6811996  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

https://disaster.salvationarmyusa.org/
https://www.feedingamerica.org/
https://www.feedingamerica.org/take-action/coronavirus
https://www.walmart.com/cp/fight-hunger/6811996
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Eligibility and Description/Use: Individuals & Households, Local Government & Authority, 
Nonprofit Organizations Food bank locations and eligibility information can be found at: 
https://www.feedingamerica.org/find-your-local-foodbank 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: 1. Feeding America secures donations from national food and 
grocery 
manufacturers, retailers, shippers, packers and growers and from government agencies 
and other organizations 
2. The Feeding America network of food banks receive and safely stores donated food 
and grocery products. Feeding America supports member food banks with training, 
oversight and equipment grants to ensure perishable and non-perishable food is handled 
and stored properly 
3. The food banks distribute food and grocery items through food pantries and meal 
programs that serve families, children, seniors and individuals at risk of hunger 
 
Food bank locations and eligibility information can be found at: 
https://www.feedingamerica.org/find-your-local-foodbank 
 
https://www.feedingamerica.org/  
https://www.feedingamerica.org/take-action/coronavirus  
Fight Hunger & Spark Change partnership: https://www.walmart.com/cp/fight-
hunger/6811996  

Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: https://www.feedingamerica.org/take-action/coronavirus 

 

R20. Cooperative Development Foundation - Disaster Recovery Fund (Ongoing) 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The Cooperative Development Foundation promotes community, 
economic, and social development through cooperative enterprise. CDF does this by:  a) 
raising and distributing funds for economic and community development projects; b) 
building partnerships that create cooperative solutions to today's economic problems; 
and c) raising awareness of the role cooperatives play in the nation's and the world's 
economies. CDF's resources are used to support cooperative development through 
direct expenditure and grants and loans to cooperatives, cooperative organizations, and 
groups forming cooperatives.  

The Disaster Recovery Fund helps cooperatives and cooperators get back on their feet 
after disasters or other emergency hardship situations. Funding is provided for: 

• Aid to employees and volunteers of cooperatives and cooperative support 
organizations to support recovery from disasters or emergencies. Basic 
necessities, such as food, clothing, housing (including repairs) transportation and 
medical assistance (including psychological counseling). 

• Aid to cooperatives by covering uninsured expenses needed to return the 
business to viability. 

https://www.feedingamerica.org/take-action/coronavirus
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Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations, Territory, Tribe Cooperatives 
and cooperative support organizations. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Contact foundation for details. 
 

Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: https://www.cdf.coop/disaster-recovery-fund 
 

R21. Rudolf Steiner Foundation - Social Enterprise Loans, Food System Loans, 

Integrated Capital, Seed Fund, Urban Teachers 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : They provide funding to social enterprises in the U.S. and Canada 
that are working to create long-term social and ecological benefit. Broad areas of 
expertise are food & agriculture, education & the arts, and climate & environment.  

https://rsfsocialfinance.org/ 
https://rsfsocialfinance.org/coronavirus/ 

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations Eligibility criteria- Non-profit 
status:  
The RSF Seed Fund accepts proposals from organizations that are any of the following: 
o 501(c)(3) tax-exempt per the IRS 
o Fiscally sponsored with 501(c)(3) tax-exempt status per the IRS 
o Schools or universities 
o Non-governmental entities, Indian tribes or tribal non-profit organizations, and 
territorial, tribal, or unit of local government entities 
o New initiatives defined, for the purposes of this Fund, as: 
o Organizations in their first two years of operation; 
o New projects or programs, less than two years old, from organizations with an 
operating history greater than two years. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Get funding: https://rsfsocialfinance.org/get-funding/funding-
overview/  

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://rsfsocialfinance.org/coronavirus/ 
 

https://www.cdf.coop/disaster-recovery-fund
https://rsfsocialfinance.org/
https://rsfsocialfinance.org/coronavirus/
https://rsfsocialfinance.org/coronavirus/
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R22. FY22 Bob Woodruff Family Foundation, Inc. - NFL Grants Program 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Program Description : The Bob Woodruff Foundation - in partnership with the National 
Football League (NFL) - offers NFL Grants, which support nonprofit organizations with 
programs that help our service members, veterans, and their families and caregivers 
thrive.  2021 grants will reflect the evolving needs of the military/veteran community in 
the current pandemic, with special emphasis upon food insecurity (to include upstream 
legal and financial needs that threaten food security), housing and homelessness, 
mental health, and employment.    

BWF is interested in programs that focus on: 

• Housing and homelessness prevention; 

• Clinical mental health care, provided virtually; 

• Virtual peer-to-peer support and socialization opportunities; 

• Emergency financial and hunger relief; 

• Promoting healthy lifestyles; 

• Employment services; AND/OR 

• Strengthening community-based service coordination. 

Applications may be submitted throughout the year.  Visit the Foundation's website for 
more information about the NFL Grants program. 

  

Program webpage: 

https://bobwoodrufffoundation.org/nfl-grants/  

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Nonprofit Organizations Programs considered for funding 
must be administered through a 501(c)(3) nonprofit organization. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Apply via the BWF grant application portal:  
https://bobwoodruff.force.com/bwfgrants. 
 
The Bob Woodruff Foundation reviews each application individually in the order they 
were received.  We will contact every program that submits an application informing 
them of our determination.  We ask that applicants remain patient while our team is 
working through our process. 

Cost Share: No.  

Reference Link: https://bobwoodrufffoundation.org/nfl-grants/ 
 

https://bobwoodrufffoundation.org/nfl-grants/
https://bobwoodrufffoundation.org/nfl-grants/
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R23. DanPaul Foundation Grants 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : The Foundation is interested in providing funding to programs that 
directly serve the health, education, development, and welfare of the world's youth and 
provide grants related to the following program areas:  

• WORKSHOPS, CONFERENCES, + SEMINARS:  They strive to offer educational 
workshops, conferences, and seminars for parents and teachers on topics 
related to early childhood development. 

• STUDENT SCHOLARSHIPS:  They aim to help students attending post-
secondary education institutions by providing need-based and academic 
scholarships. 

• SCIENTIFIC ENDEAVORS:  They desire to advance scientific endeavors which 
seek to improve the quality of life for everyone in the world. 

• CLEAN AIR + WATER:  They hope to pass on knowledge and practical life skills 
to youth regarding their personal responsibility to the environment, teaching them 
about issues surrounding clean air and water. 

• CHILD ADVOCACY:  They believe in protecting children from abuse and neglect 
and particularly love to support programs that provide education and assistance 
to children as well as organizations advocating or caring for vulnerable children. 

• HOMELESSNESS:  They want to encourage young people to take a personal 
interest in seeing that adequate housing and proper nutrition, especially for the 
underprivileged and homeless, are available. 

• POVERTY + NEGLECT:  They seek to help those in poverty as well as educate 
youth about their responsibility to consider the underprivileged and take care of 
those most in need of life's basic essentials like adequate housing and proper 
nutrition. 

• REFUGEE ENRICHMENT:  They wish to help refugee youth by supporting 
programs that provide them enrichment and help them transition to life in a new 
country. 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: $15,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations, 
Public/Private Institutions of Higher Education, State, Territory, Tribe The DanPaul 
Foundation provides grants to 501(c)(3) tax-exempt nonprofit organizations as defined 
by the IRS.  

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Not identified 

Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: http://www.danpaulfoundation.org/grant-funding-guidelines 

http://www.danpaulfoundation.org/grant-funding-guidelines
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R24. Notah Begay III Foundation - COVID-19 Response Fund 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Not identified 

Program Description : Funding for Native American communities being hardest hit by the 
COVID-19 pandemic to support relief efforts focused on:  

• Ensuring access to healthy nutrition/clean water; 

• Personal protective equipment; and 

• Educational supplies. 

Program webpage: 
https://www.nb3foundation.org/covid-19-response-fund/ 

FY21 NOFA (RHIhub): 
https://www.ruralhealthinfo.org/funding/5093 

 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: $10,000 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations, 
Tribe Eligible applicants include: 
* Native-Led nonprofit organizations; 
* Federally and state recognized tribes; and 
* Community-based groups using a fiscal sponsor. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Applications will be accepted until all funds are distributed.  Submit 
the online application:  https://www.nb3foundation.org/covid-19-response-fund/. 

Cost Share:   

Reference Link: https://www.nb3foundation.org/covid-19-response-fund/ 
 

R25. Allen Foundation, Inc. 

Resource Type: Grant  

Agency/Organization: Non-Governmental Organizations 

Funding Type: Non-Supplemental 

Program Description : To make grants to fund relevant nutritional research; (1) To 
support programs for the education and training of mothers during pregnancy and after 
the birth of their children, so that good nutritional habits can be formed at an early age; 
(2) To assist in the training of persons to work as educators and demonstrators of good 
nutritional practices; (3) To encourage the dissemination of information regarding 
healthful nutritional practices and habits; and (4) In limited situations, to make grants to 
help solve immediate emergency hunger and malnutrition problems.  

The connections between diet and health remain a basic and primary priority, and 
consideration has always been given to projects that benefit nutritional programs in the 

https://www.nb3foundation.org/covid-19-response-fund/
https://www.ruralhealthinfo.org/funding/5093
https://www.nb3foundation.org/covid-19-response-fund/
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areas of education, training, and research. Low priority has traditionally been given to 
proposals that help solve immediate or emergency hunger and malnutrition problems. 

http://www.allenfoundation.org/ 

Total Program Funding: Not identified 

Max Award: Not identified 

Eligibility and Description/Use: Local Government & Authority, Nonprofit Organizations 
Nonprofit charitable/educational organizations with federal tax exemption under Section 
501(c)(3) of the Internal Revenue Code or international equivalent. In certain 
circumstances, the Allen Foundation will consider requests from hospitals or medical 
clinics; social, religious, fraternal, or community organizations; private foundations; and 
K-12 public, parochial, or private schools. Preference may be given to proposals that 
include matching funds or in-kind contributions from the applicant institution or other 
partners. 

Application Deadline: Applications Accepted Continuously:  

Application Process: Deadlines are posted online. Only online submissions of grant 
proposals will be considered. Please reference the website for complete guidelines, 
restrictions, and access to the online application process. 
 
https://www.allenfoundation.org/how-to-apply/ 

Cost Share: Not Identified.  

Reference Link: http://www.allenfoundation.org/ 

 

http://www.allenfoundation.org/
http://www.allenfoundation.org/

